



PRICE TABULATION
Purchase of Plumbing and Pipefitting Maintenance & Repair Services

Item	A-Ram Plumbing, Inc.		Bolin Plumbing, Ltd.		Columbia Contracting Corporation		TD Industries		Way Engineering, LTD	
	Prime Time	Outside Prime Time	Prime Time	Outside Prime Time	Prime Time	Outside Prime Time	Prime Time	Outside Prime Time	Prime Time	Outside Prime Time
1	\$85.00	\$127.50	\$110.00	\$165.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$80.00	\$120.00	\$85.00	\$106.00
2	\$65.00	\$97.50	\$110.00	\$165.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$80.00	\$120.00	\$79.00	\$99.00
3	\$49.00	\$73.50	\$50.00	\$75.00	\$38.00	\$49.40	\$70.00	\$105.00	\$68.00	\$85.00
4	\$65.00	\$97.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$65.00	\$84.50	\$85.00	\$127.50	\$74.00	\$94.00
5	\$89.00	\$133.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$65.00	\$84.50	\$85.00	\$127.50	\$70.00	\$87.00
6	\$89.00	\$133.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.00	\$42.90	\$80.00	\$120.00	\$79.00	\$99.00
7	\$85.00	\$127.50	\$110.00	\$165.00	\$78.00	\$101.40	\$95.00	\$142.50	\$90.00	\$112.00
8	\$85.00	\$127.50	\$110.00	\$165.00	\$82.00	\$107.00	\$95.00	\$142.50	\$95.00	\$119.00
Price Rank	3	4	2	2	1	1	5	5	4	3
Technical Rank	1	1	2	2	4	4	3	3	5	5
Overall Rank	3	3	2	2	1	1	4	4	5	5

Note: Evaluation of the proposal pricing included the Alamo Colleges District best estimates for work required in a one-year period.